Summary of Open Book Tenders for 65 Delhi Street

Number |Bid Package Company Value Notes
02 00 00 - Abatement

020000 [Abatement Schouten Excavating Inc S 10,000.00
020000 [Abatement FPR Environmental Inc. S 12,080.00
020000 |Abatement Zero Environmental No Bid

02 00 00 - Selective Demolition

02 00 00 |Selective Demolition Triple-M-Demolition No Bid

02 00 00 |Selective Demolition Tri-Phase Group Inc. No Bid

02 00 00 |Selective Demolition Priestly Demolition Inc. No Bid

02 00 00 |Selective Demolition Titan Demolition No Bid

02 0000 [Selective Demolition Flatten Services S 418,300.00 |Includes Abatement
02 00 00 |Selective Demolition Hersey Demolition No Bid

02 00 00 |Selective Demolition Sittler Demolition & Environmental No Bid

02 0000 [Selective Demolition Schouten Excavating Inc S 450,000.00
02 00 00 - Shoring

02 0000 |Shoring Northstar Scaffold Inc. S 68,000.00
02 0000 |Shoring Don Fry Scaffold Services Inc. No Bid

02 0000 |Shoring Action Scaffold Services No Bid

02 0000 |Shoring MGA Scaffolding S 66,700.00
03 11 00 - Forming

031100 |Forming BCON No Bid

031100 |Forming JMJ Rock Forming No Bid

031100 [Forming WATB Construction Inc. No Bid

031100 |Forming John Hehn Construction Ltd No Bid

031100 [Forming Fortress Concrete Forming Inc. S 103,200.00
031100 |Forming Solid Concrete Solutions No Bid

031100 |Forming Alder Concrete Group Ltd. No Bid

031100 |Forming Able Concrete No Bid

031100 |Forming Horizon Concrete Construction Ltd No Bid

03 20 00 - Reinforcing Steel

03 2000 |Reinforcing Steel Nucor Harris Rebar S 32,000.00
03 2000 |Reinforcing Steel Salit Steel No Bid

03 2000 |Reinforcing Steel AGF Rebar Inc. S 27,000.00
03 2000 |Reinforcing Steel Mansteel Rebar Ltd No Bid

03 20 00 |Reinforcing Steel ACE STEELS REBAR LTD. No Bid

03 30 00 - Concrete Suppliers

033000 |Concrete Suppliers Tri City Ready Mix No Bid




033000 |Concrete Suppliers Dufferin Concrete S 30,000.00
033000 |Concrete Suppliers Lehigh Hanson Ready Mix No Bid

033000 |Concrete Suppliers CBM Ready Mix S 32,000.00
033000 |Concrete Suppliers LAFARGE CANADA INC S 24,000.00
033000 |Concrete Suppliers Hogg Ready Mix No Bid

033000 |Concrete Suppliers Miller Concrete No Bid

03 35 00 - Concrete Finishing

033500 |Concrete Finishing Tri Con Haid Concrete Finishing Ltd. No Bid

033500 |Concrete Finishing Terra Construction Ltd. No Bid

033500 |Concrete Finishing Northfleet Concrete Floor Inc. No Bid

033500 |Concrete Finishing Fortress Concrete Forming Inc. S 42,800.00
033500 |Concrete Finishing Superior Concrete Finishing No Bid

033500 |Concrete Finishing United Floor Ltd. No Bid

03 30 00 - Structural Precast

034000 [Structural Precast Stubbes Precast Commercial Inc. S 95,700.00
034000 |Structural Precast Coreslab Structures Inc. (Dundas) S 98,500.00
034000 [Structural Precast Fritzall S 105,400.00
034000 [Structural Precast Prestressed Systems Inc. S 96,450.00
034000 |Structural Precast Modular Precast Systems No Bid

04 20 00 - Masonry

042000 [Masonry Konia Masonry Corp. No Bid

042000 [Masonry GA Masonry S 285,000.00
042000 [Masonry Core Tec. Contracting No Bid

042000 [Masonry Gosse Masonry Inc No Bid

042000 [Masonry JVH Masonry No Bid

04 2000 |Masonry Columbia Masonry No Bid

042000 [Masonry Via-Con Masonry No Bid

04 2000 |Masonry Render Construction Inc. No Bid

042000 [Masonry Granite Ridge Masonry S 194,400.00
04 2000 |Masonry Mussen Masonry Ltd. No Bid

05 50 00 - Structural Steel & Misc. Metals

055000 |Structural Steel & Misc. Metals Golden Triangle Welding Ltd. No Bid

055000 [Structural Steel & Misc. Metals Oskam Welding & Machine Limited S 488,900.00
055000 |Structural Steel & Misc. Metals ACL Steel Ltd No Bid

055000 |Structural Steel & Misc. Metals Rosmar Welding Inc. No Bid

055000 |Structural Steel & Misc. Metals JCT Metals Inc No Bid

055000 |Structural Steel & Misc. Metals Metalcon Inc No Bid

055000 |Structural Steel & Misc. Metals Akal Steel No Bid

055000 |Structural Steel & Misc. Metals Steelcon Fabricators No Bid




055000 [Structural Steel & Misc. Metals Circelli Steel Ltd. S 387,200.00
055000 |Structural Steel & Misc. Metals KWO Ironworks Limited No Bid

055000 |Structural Steel & Misc. Metals BBK No Bid

055000 [Structural Steel & Misc. Metals Galt Metal Fabrication LTD S 412,000.00
06 40 00 - Millwork

06 40 00 |Millwork Archmill House Inc. & Atkar North America No Bid

06 40 00 |Millwork Baywood Interiors Ltd. No Bid

06 40 00 |Millwork Bendt Kitchens and Millwork Inc. No Bid

06 40 00 |Millwork Emily Creek Woodworking Inc. S 154,593.00
06 4000 |Millwork Bamco Custom Woodworking No Bid

064000 [Millwork Matador Millwork Inc. S 100,348.00
06 4000 |Millwork Emily Creek Woodworking Ltd. No Bid

06 40 00 |Millwork Kitchen Appeal S 95,900.00
06 40 00 |Millwork DM Millwork No Bid

064000 [Millwork Choice Cabinet Canada S 102,000.00
06 40 00 |Millwork FCF Carpentry Inc No Bid

06 40 00 |Millwork CCW Inc. No Bid

06 40 00 |Millwork GL Industries Ltd. No Bid

06 43 00 - Wood Stairs and Railings

06 4300 |Wood Stairs and Railings [Heritage mill [ $ 275,600.00
07 13 26 - Waterproofing

07 13 26 |Waterproofing Devonshire Restoration and Waterproofing Inc. No Bid

07 13 26 |Waterproofing Aquanorth Contracting Ltd. No Bid

07 13 26 |Waterproofing Conestoga Roofing & Sheet Metal No Bid

07 13 26 |Waterproofing Bothwell-Accurate Company S 56,400.00
07 13 26 |Waterproofing Nusite Contractors Ltd. No Bid

07 13 26 |Waterproofing BBS Waterproofing Inc. No Bid

07 13 26 |Waterproofing The R & D Development Group Inc. No Bid

07 42 13 - Metal Siding, Aluminum Composite Panel

07 42 13 |Metal Siding, Aluminum Composite Panel RITZ Architectural Systems Inc. No Bid

07 42 13 |Metal Siding, Aluminum Composite Panel Igloo Installations Inc. No Bid

07 42 13 |Metal Siding, Aluminum Composite Panel John Kenyon No Bid

07 42 13 |Metal Siding, Aluminum Composite Panel Gage Metal Cladding Limited No Bid

07 42 13 |Metal Siding, Aluminum Composite Panel Praxy Cladding Corp No Bid

07 42 13 |Metal Siding, Aluminum Composite Panel Triumph Inc. No Bid

07 42 13 |Metal Siding, Aluminum Composite Panel Bothwell-Accurate Company No Bid

07 42 13 |Metal Siding, Aluminum Composite Panel Semple Gooder Roofing Ltd. No Bid

07 42 13 |Metal Siding, Aluminum Composite Panel SM Cladding Solutions No Bid

07 42 13 |Metal Siding, Aluminum Composite Panel Lonelm Construction Company No Bid




07 42 13 |Metal Siding, Aluminum Composite Panel Next Alutech S 136,300.00
07 42 13 |Metal Siding, Aluminum Composite Panel Brass Monkey Installations Ltd. S 190,754.00
07 42 13 |Metal Siding, Aluminum Composite Panel Vision AES No Bid

07 51 00 - Shingle Roofing

07 5100 |Shingle Roofing Bothwell-Accurate Company No Bid

07 5100 |Shingle Roofing Aseal Roofing and Sheetmetal Ltd. No Bid

07 5100 |Shingle Roofing WM. Green Roofing Ltd. No Bid

07 5100 |Shingle Roofing Conestoga Roofing & Sheet Metal No Bid

07 5100 |Shingle Roofing Dean-Thackeray Roofing Company Ltd No Bid

07 5100 |Shingle Roofing Nortex Roofing Ltd. No Bid

07 5100 |Shingle Roofing Semple Gooder Roofing Ltd. No Bid

07 5100 |Shingle Roofing Dean Thackeray Roofing Company Ltd No Bid

07 5100 |Shingle Roofing Eileen Roofing Inc. No Bid

07 5100 |Shingle Roofing Garcia Roofing Ltd S 106,700.00
07 5100 |Shingle Roofing Black And White Roofing Inc. S 119,158.00
07 5100 |Shingle Roofing AM Group of Companies No Bid

07 5100 |Shingle Roofing Jims Roofing Ltd No Bid

07 5100 |Shingle Roofing Flynn Group of Companies No Bid

07 81 00 - Applied Fireproofing/Sprayed Insulation/Intumescent Paint

07 81 00 |Applied Fireproofing/Sprayed Insulation/Intumescent Paint Great Northern Insulation No Bid

07 81 00 |Applied Fireproofing/Sprayed Insulation/Intumescent Paint Nexlevel Construction Solutions Inc. No Bid

07 81 00 |Applied Fireproofing/Sprayed Insulation/Intumescent Paint Donalco Inc. S 59,400.00
07 81 00 |Applied Fireproofing/Sprayed Insulation/Intumescent Paint Enerliv No Bid

07 81 00 |Applied Fireproofing/Sprayed Insulation/Intumescent Paint Golden Gate Spray Foam and Fireproofing S 63,200.00
07 92 00 - Joint Sealants

0792 00 [Joint Sealants Lorandi Group Inc. S 23,400.00
079200 |Joint Sealants F & M Caulking Ltd. No Bid

079200 |Joint Sealants Beverly Caulking & Firestopping No Bid

079200 |Joint Sealants Bayview Caulking No Bid

079200 |Joint Sealants Regional Sealants & Waterproof No Bid

079200 |Joint Sealants Costa Caulking No Bid

08 11 00 - Metal Doors, Frames and Hardware

081100 |Metal Doors, Frames and Hardware Pro-Able Doors & Systems Inc. No Bid

081100 |Metal Doors, Frames and Hardware Group87 Architectural Hardware Inc. No Bid

08 11 00 [Metal Doors, Frames and Hardware Southwest Doors & Hardware No Bid

08 11 00 [Metal Doors, Frames and Hardware Trillium Architectural Products Ltd. No Bid

081100 |Metal Doors, Frames and Hardware Regional Doors and Hardware No Bid

08 11 00 [Metal Doors, Frames and Hardware All Can Doors & Hardware Inc. No Bid

08 11 00 [Metal Doors, Frames and Hardware All Pro Door and Hardware Ltd. S 114,611.00




08 11 00 [Metal Doors, Frames and Hardware Knell's Door Hardware No Bid

08 11 00 [Metal Doors, Frames and Hardware Lockdoor Canada No Bid

08 11 00 [Metal Doors, Frames and Hardware Great Lakes Architectural Inc. No Bid

08 11 00 [Metal Doors, Frames and Hardware Tykel Inc. S 112,600.00
08 41 00 - Glass & Glazing

084100 |Glass & Glazing Glass Canada No Bid

084100 |Glass & Glazing KW Glass Systems No Bid

084100 |Glass & Glazing Ellis Glass & Mirror Ltd. No Bid

084100 |Glass & Glazing Barrie Glass & Mirror Ltd. No Bid

084100 |Glass & Glazing Westmount Storefront Systems Ltd. S 339,200.00 [Aluminum
084100 |Glass & Glazing Shantz Windows No Bid

084100 |Glass & Glazing Ontario Glass Werx Inc No Bid

084100 |Glass & Glazing Kanada building envelope No Bid

084100 |Glass & Glazing Kitchener Glass Ltd. No Bid

084100 |Glass & Glazing VDK Group No Bid

09 21 00 - Drywall

092100 |Drywall Rosmar Drywall Ltd. No Bid

092100 |Drywall Smith Brothers Contracting Corp. No Bid

092100 |Drywall Cambridge Drywall Services Ltd S 1,141,600.00
092100 |Drywall Life Drywall Systems Ltd. S 747,600.00
092100 |Drywall Alles Drywall No Bid

092100 |Drywall Sanchedrywall No Bid

092100 |Drywall Donmor Drywall No Bid

092100 |Drywall Grassing Drywall & Acoustics Ltd. No Bid

092100 |Drywall Kirlen Construction Incorporated No Bid

092100 |Drywall New Generation Group No Bid

092100 |Drywall Marel Contractors No Bid

092100 |Drywall H.A.Madill Drywall Ltd. S 765,600.00 |Includes Sprayed Insulation
09 24 00 - PlasterRestoration

09 24 00 |Plaster Restoration Roof Tile Management Inc. No Bid

09 24 00 |Plaster Restoration Acanthus Heritage Plastering No Bid

09 24 00 |Plaster Restoration Iconoplast Designs Inc. No Bid

09 24 00 |Plaster Restoration Fine Restoration No Bid

09 24 00 |Plaster Restoration The Lime Plaster Company ltd No Bid

09 24 00 |Plaster Restoration Schuit Plastering & Stucco Co. No Bid

09 24 00 [Plaster Restoration Historic Plaster Conservation Services Limited S 50,000.00 |Estimate based on Day Rate
09 24 00 |Plaster Restoration Canex Contracting Inc No Bid

09 60 00 - Flooring

09 6000 [Flooring ZET Master | No Bid




09 60 00 |Flooring Great Floors Canada S 273,272.00
09 6000 |Flooring Classic Tile Contractors Ltd. No Bid

09 60 00 |Flooring Dave Scholten FLooring No Bid

09 60 00 |Flooring Malvern Contract Interiors Ltd. No Bid

09 60 00 |Flooring Twin City Tile Ltd. No Bid

09 60 00 |Flooring Volls Contract Flooring Ltd. No Bid

09 60 00 |Flooring BIGELOW FLOORING INC No Bid

09 60 00 |Flooring Grand Valley Tile Company No Bid

09 60 00 |Flooring H And V Carpeting Inc S 211,200.00
09 90 00 - Painting & Wall Coverings

099000 |Painting & Wall Coverings IMJ Enterprises Inc. No Bid

099000 |Painting & Wall Coverings Westwood Painting Services Inc. No Bid

099000 |Painting & Wall Coverings Greenfield Painting No Bid

099000 |Painting & Wall Coverings Expert Painting No Bid

099000 |Painting & Wall Coverings Aves & Shaw Limited No Bid

099000 |Painting & Wall Coverings R & S Painting No Bid

099000 |Painting & Wall Coverings CPE Painting Decorating S 70,400.00
099000 |Painting & Wall Coverings Marando Painting Ltd. No Bid

099000 |Painting & Wall Coverings Livios Painting and Restoration S 75,848.45
099000 |Painting & Wall Coverings Aves & Shaw Ltd No Bid

10 28 00 - Bathroom Accessories

1028 00 [Bathroom Accessories Inter-Co Division 10 Inc. No Bid

1028 00 [Bathroom Accessories Belroc Interiors Inc. No Bid

1028 00 [Bathroom Accessories Canadian Washroom Products Inc. No Bid

1028 00 [Bathroom Accessories Knell's Door Hardware No Bid

1028 00 [Bathroom Accessories Mira Washroom Products Specialties Ltd No Bid

1028 00 [Bathroom Accessories Eastern Partitions Ltd. No Bid

12 20 00 - Window Coverings

122000 [Window Coverings Solarfective Products Ltd. No Bid

122000 [Window Coverings EN3 Sun Protection No Bid

122000 [Window Coverings 200 Vic Ltd No Bid

122000 [Window Coverings ProMark Window Film & Blinds Inc. No Bid

14 00 00 - Elevators

140000 [Elevators [Delta Elevator Co Ltd [ $ 228,700.00
21 00 00 - Fire Sprinkler

210000 |Fire Sprinkler Vipond Inc No Bid

210000 |Fire Sprinkler Stumpf Fire Protection Limited S 136,100.00
210000 |Fire Sprinkler C & H Fire Suppression Systems S 120,850.00
210000 |Fire Sprinkler Spira Fire Protection S 117,200.00




210000 |Fire Sprinkler Western Fire Protection Inc. No Bid

210000 |Fire Sprinkler Classic Fire + Life Safety S 117,457.00
210000 |Fire Sprinkler Troy Life & Fire Safety Ltd. No Bid

210000 |Fire Sprinkler Nutech Fire Prevention Inc. S 117,620.00
23 00 00 - Mechanical

230000 |Mechanical CJS Express No Bid

230000 |Mechanical Dean-Lane Contractors Inc. S 1,433,700.00
230000 |Mechanical Velocity Mechanical Inc. S 1,273,900.00
230000 |Mechanical Wellington Plumbing & Heating Ltd. S 1,337,500.00
230000 |Mechanical Jay Stewart Mechanical S 1,367,100.00
26 00 00 - Electrical

26 0000 |Electrical Arcadian Projects No Bid

26 00 00 |[Electrical CJS Express S 793,000.00
26 0000 |Electrical JM Electrical Contracting No Bid

26 0000 |Electrical MJM Electric Ltd No Bid

26 0000 |Electrical Yake Electric Limited No Bid

31 00 00 - Earthwork

310000 [Earthwork Alfred Fach Excavating Limited S 260,700.00
310000 |Earthwork Percon Excavating Incorporated No Bid

310000 |Earthwork Musselman Excavating No Bid

310000 |Earthwork G. Melo Excavating Ltd No Bid

310000 [Earthwork Schouten Excavating Inc S 280,000.00
310000 |Earthwork Blue-Con Construction No Bid

310000 [Earthwork Navacon Construction Inc S 280,000.00
310000 |Earthwork KIESWETTER EXCAVATING INC. S 295,200.00
310000 |Earthwork Deep Reach Excavating Inc No Bid

32 10 00 - Asphalt

321000 |Asphalt Alex Paving Ltd. No Bid

321000 |Asphalt Brantco Construction No Bid

321000 |Asphalt 5 Star Paving Construction Group S 44,297.00
321000 |Asphalt Capital Paving Inc. No Bid

321000 |Asphalt K-W Cornerstone Paving Ltd. S 37,900.00
321000 |Asphalt Steed & Evans No Bid

321000 |Asphalt Green Infrastructure Partners Inc. No Bid

32 10 20 - Site Concrete

321020 |[Site Concrete Brantco Construction No Bid

321020 |Site Concrete Capital Paving Inc. No Bid

321020 |[Site Concrete Sousa Concrete No Bid

321020 |Site Concrete Vista Contractng Ltd No Bid




321020 |Site Concrete N. Piccoli Construction Limited No Bid
321020 |Site Concrete Ontario Bollards Inc No Bid
321020 |Site Concrete Hardscape Concrete & Interlock No Bid
32 1020 |Site Concrete Steed & Evans No Bid
32 90 00 - Landscape

329200 |Landscape Cambridge Landscaping & Construction Ltd. No Bid
329200 |Landscape Bomar Landscaping Inc. No Bid
329200 |Landscape Oakridge Landscape Contractors Ltd. No Bid
329200 |Landscape Moser Landscape Group No Bid
329200 |Landscape Aldershot Landscape Contractors Limited No Bid
329200 |Landscape Coulson Landscaping No Bid
329200 |Landscape Cedar Springs Landscape Group No Bid
329200 |Landscape Ghent Landscape No Bid
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